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Understanding Autism: Symptoms, Diagnosis, and Treatment 

Autism Spectrum Disorder (ASD) is a complex neurodevelopmental condition that affects 
individuals across the world. Characterized by a wide range of symptoms and behaviors, 
autism has garnered significant attention from researchers, clinicians, and the general 
public. This comprehensive article aims to explore the symptoms, diagnosis, and treatment 
of autism, shedding light on the challenges and advancements in our understanding of 
this condition. 

Autism Spectrum Disorder: An Overview 

Autism Spectrum Disorder is a term used to describe a group of related developmental 
disorders that affect social interaction, communication, and behavior. The name 
"spectrum" highlights the diversity in the presentation and severity of symptoms among 
individuals with autism. While two individuals with autism may share certain core features, 
their experiences and needs can differ significantly. 

Symptoms of Autism 

1. Social Challenges:  

Impaired social interaction is a hallmark feature of autism. Individuals with autism may 
struggle to establish and maintain relationships, have difficulty understanding social cues, 
and exhibit limited interest in social activities. 

2. Communication Difficulties:  

Communication deficits are common in autism. Some individuals may have delayed 
speech development, while others may not develop verbal communication at all. Non-
verbal communication, such as gestures and eye contact, can also be challenging for many 
individuals with autism. 

3. Repetitive Behaviors:  

Many individuals with autism engage in repetitive behaviors or routines. These can include 
hand-flapping, rocking, or obsessive interests in specific topics or objects. 

4. Sensory Sensitivities:  

Hypersensitivity or hyposensitivity to sensory stimuli is prevalent among those with autism. 
Some individuals may be extremely sensitive to sights, sounds, textures, or smells, while 
others may seek out sensory stimulation. 

5. Rigid Thinking:  

People with autism often exhibit rigid thinking patterns and resistance to change. They 
may become upset when routines are disrupted or when confronted with unexpected 
situations. 

6. Intense Focus:  

Some individuals with autism possess exceptional attention to detail and can excel in 
specific areas of interest. This trait is often associated with "special talents" in fields like 
mathematics, music, or art. 
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7. Difficulty with Empathy:  

Understanding and expressing empathy can be challenging for many individuals with 
autism. They may struggle to recognize and respond to the emotions of others. 

Diagnosis of Autism 

Diagnosing autism is a complex process that typically involves multiple assessments by 
healthcare professionals. The diagnosis is generally made based on a comprehensive 
evaluation of an individual's behavior and developmental history. Here are the key steps in 
the diagnostic process: 

1. Screening:  

Pediatricians and healthcare providers often use standardized screening tools to identify 
children at risk for autism. The Modified Checklist for Autism in Toddlers (M-CHAT) is a 
commonly used screening tool. 

2. Comprehensive Assessment: 

If a child's screening suggests a potential risk of autism, they will undergo a more thorough 
evaluation. This evaluation may involve a developmental pediatrician, child psychologist, or 
other specialists who assess the child's behavior, communication, and social interactions. 
Healthcare providers may use an assessment tool called the ADOS (Autism Diagnostic 
Observation Schedule ) or the Cars (Childhood Autism Rating Scale) tool to more accurately 
assess whether a child is on the autism spectrum. 

3. Diagnostic Criteria:  

The diagnosis of autism is based on specific criteria outlined in the Diagnostic and 
Statistical Manual of Mental Disorders (DSM-5). To receive an autism diagnosis, an 
individual must meet the criteria outlined in this manual. 

4. Observation and Interviews:  

Healthcare professionals may observe the individual in various settings and interview 
parents, caregivers, and teachers to gather information about the person's behavior and 
developmental history (ADOS and CARS testing tools). 

5. Medical Evaluation:  

Sometimes, medical tests are conducted to rule out other conditions that might present 
with similar symptoms. These tests can include genetic testing, brain imaging, and 
metabolic screenings. 

6. Team Approach:  

The diagnostic process often involves a multidisciplinary team, including psychologists, 
speech-language pathologists, occupational therapists, and pediatricians, working 
together to provide a comprehensive assessment. 

It's important to note that autism can be diagnosed at any age, from infancy through 
adulthood. Early diagnosis and intervention can significantly improve outcomes for 
individuals with autism. 



 

 3 
 

Treatment and Interventions 

Once diagnosed, individuals with autism can benefit from a range of treatments and 
interventions tailored to their specific needs. Autism is a lifelong condition, and there is no 
cure, but early and effective intervention can help individuals with autism lead fulfilling lives 
and reach their full potential. Treatment and intervention strategies may include: 

Behavioral Therapies 

1. Applied Behavior Analysis (ABA):  

ABA is a widely used and evidence-based approach that focuses on teaching and 
reinforcing positive behaviors while reducing unwanted behaviors. It is often used to 
improve communication, social skills, and adaptive behaviors. 

2. Speech and Language Therapy:  

Speech therapists work with individuals with autism to improve their communication skills, 
including speech, language, and non-verbal communication. 

3. Occupational Therapy:  

Occupational therapists help individuals with autism develop skills to perform daily tasks, 
manage sensory sensitivities, and improve fine and gross motor skills. 

Educational Interventions 

1. Early Intervention:  

Early intervention services provide specialized support to infants and toddlers with autism 
and their families. These services aim to promote developmental progress in areas like 
communication and social skills. 

2. Special Education Programs:  

Many individuals with autism benefit from special education programs that provide 
tailored instruction and support in mainstream or specialized settings.  The PPCD program 
(Preschool Program for Children with Disabilities) is a program offered at your local 
elementary school which seeks to give preschool aged children 3-5 years of age a half day 
of help and therapies which can help further advance speech and pragmatic skill sets. 
Special schools such as the Parish School, The Monarch School, Westview Academy and 
Gateway Academy offer full academic primary and secondary school settings where both 
academics and the particular challenges children with Autism are addressed.  

Medication 

1. Medication Management: 

Some individuals with autism may benefit from medication to manage co-occurring 
conditions such as anxiety, depression, or attention-deficit/hyperactivity disorder (ADHD). 

 Supportive Services 

1. Behavioral Supports:  

These services focus on helping individuals with autism and their families develop 
strategies to address challenging behaviors and improve daily functioning.  The Carruth 
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Center at the Parish School offers a large variety of social skills group and individual sessions 
to help children on the spectrum with their particular social challenges.  

2. Social Skills Training:  

Social skills training programs teach individuals with autism how to navigate social 
situations, make friends, and build relationships. The Easter Seals program, Social Skills in 
Motion, is an example.  It groups children of similar ages together and plans social activities 
where the children can interact in a  non-judgmental, supportive environment.  

Alternative Therapies 

1. Dietary Interventions:  

Some families explore dietary changes, such as gluten-free or casein-free diets, to manage 
certain symptoms in individuals with autism. However, the effectiveness of these 
interventions is still a subject of debate among researchers and healthcare professionals. 

2. Sensory Integration Therapy: 

This therapy aims to help individuals with autism manage sensory sensitivities and improve 
their ability to engage in daily activities. 


